
SI-2022-00282 AA

PR-2022-006587



PR-2022-006587 SI-2022-00282



6400 Wyoming Boulevard  NE  Albuquerque, New Mexico 87109-3899

505-828-3200 phone 505-828-3320 fax www.aa.edu

January 31, 2022 

To Whom It May Concern: 

This letter is to authorize Roger Lengyel, Lengyel and Associates, Architecture and Planning, Lisc # 781, to submit to 
the City's DRB Planner the plans for a "Site Development Plan Amendment to our property." 

Thank you for your consideration. 

Sincerely,

Josh Buchanan
Physical Plant Director
| 505.828.3325 (d) | 505.269.8893 (c) | www.aa.edu |
6400 Wyoming Blvd. NE, Albuquerque, NM 87109

Sincerely,







[EXTERNAL] Forward to phishing@cabq.gov and delete if an email causes any concern.

From: Rodenbeck, Jay B.
To: rogerlengyel@aol.com; Planning Development Review Services
Cc: Webb, Robert L.; Montoya, Yolanda
Subject: RE: MINOR AMENDMENT TO SITE DEVELOPMENT PLAN APPLICATION for ALBUQUERQUE ACADEMY
Date: Tuesday, February 8, 2022 12:59:22 PM
Attachments: image001.jpg

Thanks Roger,
 
DRB team, his AA application is ready to be processed in POSSE, and will need to get a new project
number.
 
His application is located in the following location:
 
X:\PL\SHARES\PL-Share\Application_Acceptance\6400 Wyoming Blvd NE - AA (Albuquerque
Academy)
 
Once our team processes your application Roger, you will receive an invoice to pay your AA
application fee of $51.
 
 

Jay Rodenbeck
Senior Planner
o 505.924.3994
e jrodenbeck@cabq.gov
cabq.gov/planning
 
 
From: rogerlengyel@aol.com <rogerlengyel@aol.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, February 8, 2022 12:51 PM
To: Planning Development Review Services <PLNDRS@cabq.gov>; Rodenbeck, Jay B.
<jrodenbeck@cabq.gov>
Subject: MINOR AMENDMENT TO SITE DEVELOPMENT PLAN APPLICATION for ALBUQUERQUE
ACADEMY
 

Good Afternoon Jay,
 
Thank you for getting back to us so quickly.  Attached is the Completed
Form P3.
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Roger



CU-153086167Customer NO:

Reference NO: SI-2022-00282

3241 SIRINGO RDROGER LENGYEL

CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
INVOICE

Date Description Amount

2/08/22 2% Technology Fee $1.00

2/08/22 Application Fee $50.00

2/08/22 Total due for this invoice:Due Date: $51.00

1.   Online with a credit card:   http://posse.cabq.gov/posse/pub/lms/Default.aspx

2.    In person: Plaza Del Sol, 600 2nd St. NW, Albuquerque, NM 87102

Options to pay your Invoice:

City of Albuquerque

CU-153086167Customer NO:

ROGER LENGYEL
3241 SIRINGO RD
SANTA FE, NM  87507

$51.00

SI-2022-00282Reference NO:

2/08/22

Amount Due:

Date:

Albuquerque, NM 87103

PO Box 1293

PLEASE RETURN THE BOTTOM PORTION OF THIS INVOICE NOTICE WITH PAYMENT

Payment Code: 130

130 0000SI20220028200099355115308615200000000000005100CU153086167




