
Total Due $____________  

If you have questions, please contact Doug Hughes, Stormwater Quality 924-3420, jhughes@cabq.gov 

Rev Oct. 2020

Stormwater Quality Plan Information Sheet 

and Inspection Fee Schedule 
Project Name: _________________________________________________________ 
Project Location:  (address or major cross streets/arroyo) 
_____________________________________________________________________ 
Plan Preparer Information: 
Company: _______________________________________________________________ 
Contact: ________________________________________________________________ 
Address: ________________________________________________________________ 

_________________________________________________________________ 
Phone Number: (O) _____________________ (Cell (optional)) _____________________ 
e-Mail:_________________________________________________________________ 

Property Owner Information: 
Company: _______________________________________________________________ 
Contact: _________________________________________________________________ 
Address: _________________________________________________________________ 
Phone: ___________________________________________________________________ 
e-Mail:___________________________________________________________________ 
I am submitting the ESC plan to obtain approval for: 

___ Grading  ___Building Permit  ___Work Order Construction Plans 
Note: More than one item can be checked for a submittal 

Stormwater Quality Inspection fee: (based on development type and disturbed area) 
Commercial < 2 acres $300        2 to 5 acres $500  >5 acres $800   
Land/Infrastructure < 5 acres $300     5 to 40 acres $500  >40 acres $800   
Multi - family < 5 acres $500   >5 acres $800 
Single Family 
Residential 

<5 acres $500 5 to 40 acres $1000 > 40 acres $1500  

Plan Review fee is $105 for the first submittal         and $75.00 for a resubmittal 

Total due equals the plan review fee plus the Stormwater Quality Inspection fee. 



CU-112809138Customer NO:

Reference NO: SI-2021-01938

504 EL PARAISOCASSANDRA  DURKIN INSPECTIONS PLUS

CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
INVOICE

Date Description Amount

11/18/21 2% Technology Fee $12.10

11/18/21 Application Fee $605.00

11/18/21 Total due for this invoice:Due Date: $617.10

1.   Online with a credit card:   http://posse.cabq.gov/posse/pub/lms/Default.aspx

2.    In person: Plaza Del Sol, 600 2nd St. NW, Albuquerque, NM 87102

Options to pay your Invoice:

City of Albuquerque

CU-112809138Customer NO:

CASSANDRA  DURKIN INSPECTIONS
PLUS
504 EL PARAISO
ALBUQUERQUE, NM  87113

$617.10

SI-2021-01938Reference NO:

11/18/21

Amount Due:

Date:

Albuquerque, NM 87103

PO Box 1293

PLEASE RETURN THE BOTTOM PORTION OF THIS INVOICE NOTICE WITH PAYMENT

Payment Code: 130

130 0000SI20210193800099355114884751400000000000006171CU112809138



From: Cassandra Durkin
To: Hughes, James D.
Cc: Cordero, Shannon D.
Subject: FW: Payment Confirmation: 2021322001-36
Date: Thursday, November 18, 2021 1:13:48 PM

External                           
Hi!
 
Here is you payment receipt!
 
Thank You!
 
Cassandra Durkin, CPESC, CESSWI
Environmental Compliance Manager
Inspections Plus
504 El Paraiso Rd NE Ste B
Albuquerque, NM 87113
(o) 505-344-9410
(m) 505-895-1547

 

From: Rene Hartman <rene@inspectionsplus.com> 
Sent: Thursday, November 18, 2021 11:48 AM
To: Cassandra Durkin <cassandra@inspectionsplus.com>
Subject: FW: Payment Confirmation: 2021322001-36
 
 
 
Thank you!!
 
Rene Hartman
Chief Administrative Officer
Inspections Plus
504 El Paraiso Rd NE, Ste. B
Albuquerque, NM 87113
 
505-344-9410
 
WWW.inspectionsplus.com
 

From: system@ipayment.com <system@ipayment.com> 
Sent: Thursday, November 18, 2021 11:47 AM

mailto:cassandra@inspectionsplus.com
mailto:jhughes@cabq.gov
mailto:sdcordero@cabq.gov
https://ddec1-0-en-ctp.trendmicro.com/wis/clicktime/v1/query?url=http%3a%2f%2fwww.inspectionsplus.com&umid=80400fac-499f-4c2e-ab11-db08bc9d84ad&auth=307405480ca3e49a8b1deb4e49ca5cd244e7e096-87d5b177bf5dec0deb019fef24153b4473d3da7e
mailto:system@ipayment.com
mailto:system@ipayment.com


To: Rene Hartman <rene@inspectionsplus.com>
Subject: Payment Confirmation: 2021322001-36
 

Tab icon

Receipt

Your Reference Number:

2021322001-36
11/18/2021 11:45:49 AM

Transactions

Building Permits, Business Registrations, Code Enforcement Permits and
Planning Applications
 2021322001-36-1

$617.10

Name:
CASSANDRA DURKIN INSPECTIONS PLUS - CU112809138
Customer Number:
CU112809138

Permit Information $605.00

Permit Number:
SI-2021-01938
Permit Description:
PL002: Planning: Application Fee (Site Improvement Plan)
Name:
CASSANDRA DURKIN INSPECTIONS PLUS - CU112809138

Permit Information $12.10

Permit Number:
SI-2021-01938
Permit Description:
TF001: Planning: Technology Fee Application (Site Improvement Plan)
Name:
CASSANDRA DURKIN INSPECTIONS PLUS - CU112809138

Mastercard Service Fee
 2021322001-36-4

$16.97

Total Amount:$634.07
Payment

Mastercard Credit Sale M $617.10

mailto:rene@inspectionsplus.com


Card Number:
************9809
First Name:
Rene
Last Name:
Hartman

Mastercard Service Fee Credit Sale M $16.97

Card Number:
************9809
First Name:
Rene
Last Name:
Hartman
Payment Type:
credit

CE2021322001-36


	Stormwater Quality info sheet_fees_May_2019
	Invoice
	FW_ Payment Confirmation_ 2021322001-36

	Project Name 1: SAMs Academy
	Project Name 2: 6441 Ventana Rd NW 
	Company: Inspections Plus, LLC.
	Contact: Cassandra Durkin, CPESC, CESSWI
	Address: 504 El Paraiso Rd NE Suite B Albuquerque, NM 87113
	Phone Number O: 505-344-9410
	Cell optional: 
	eMail: cassandra@inspectionsplus.com
	Company_2: RM Sams, LLC.
	Contact_2: Steve Nakamura via Steve Hernandez (Representative Agent)
	Address_2: PO Box 73 Corrales, NM 87048
	Phone: 505-228-1401
	eMail_2: steve@dmcnm.com
	C5+: 
	WO40+: 
	SF5-40: 
	SF5: 
	105: x
	75: 
	Total Due: 605.00
	GR: x
	BP: x
	WO: x
	C2: 
	WO5: 
	MF5: 
	C2-5: X
	WO5-40: 
	MF5-40: 


