
Total Due $____________  

If you have questions, please contact Doug Hughes, Stormwater Quality 924-3420, jhughes@cabq.gov 

Rev Oct. 2020

Stormwater Quality Plan Information Sheet 

and Inspection Fee Schedule 
Project Name: _________________________________________________________ 
Project Location:  (address or major cross streets/arroyo) 
_____________________________________________________________________ 
Plan Preparer Information: 
Company: _______________________________________________________________ 
Contact: ________________________________________________________________ 
Address: ________________________________________________________________ 

_________________________________________________________________ 
Phone Number: (O) _____________________ (Cell (optional)) _____________________ 
e-Mail:_________________________________________________________________ 

Property Owner Information: 
Company: _______________________________________________________________ 
Contact: _________________________________________________________________ 
Address: _________________________________________________________________ 
Phone: ___________________________________________________________________ 
e-Mail:___________________________________________________________________ 
I am submitting the ESC plan to obtain approval for: 

___ Grading  ___Building Permit  ___Work Order Construction Plans 
Note: More than one item can be checked for a submittal 

Stormwater Quality Inspection fee: (based on development type and disturbed area) 
Commercial < 2 acres $300        2 to 5 acres $500  >5 acres $800   
Land/Infrastructure < 5 acres $300     5 to 40 acres $500  >40 acres $800   
Multi - family < 5 acres $500   >5 acres $800 
Single Family 
Residential 

<5 acres $500 5 to 40 acres $1000 > 40 acres $1500  

Plan Review fee is $105 for the first submittal         and $75.00 for a resubmittal 

Total due equals the plan review fee plus the Stormwater Quality Inspection fee. 



CU-168061396Customer NO:

Reference NO: SI-2022-02413

504 EL PARAISO RD. NE  STE BCHIP MARTIN INSPECTIONS PLUS

CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
INVOICE

Date Description Amount

12/20/22 2% Technology Fee $12.10

12/20/22 Application Fee $605.00

12/20/22 Total due for this invoice:Due Date: $617.10

1.   Online with a credit card:   http://posse.cabq.gov/posse/pub/lms/Default.aspx

2.    In person: Plaza Del Sol, 600 2nd St. NW, Albuquerque, NM 87102

Options to pay your Invoice:

City of Albuquerque

CU-168061396Customer NO:

CHIP MARTIN INSPECTIONS PLUS
504 EL PARAISO RD. NE  STE B
ALBUQUERQUE, NM  87113

$617.10

SI-2022-02413Reference NO:

12/20/22

Amount Due:

Date:

Albuquerque, NM 87103

PO Box 1293

PLEASE RETURN THE BOTTOM PORTION OF THIS INVOICE NOTICE WITH PAYMENT

Payment Code: 130

130 0000SI20220241300099355117260453600000000000006171CU168061396



[EXTERNAL] Forward to phishing@cabq.gov and delete if an email
causes any concern.

From: Madelyn Schauer
To: Hughes, James D.
Subject: Fw: Payment Confirmation: 2022356001-1 ... 22.12.20 ESC Plan comments for McMahon Marketplace Lots9B,

9C, and 9D at 5750 McMahon Blvd. NW - A11E011I - NMR10059B
Date: Thursday, December 22, 2022 10:33:12 PM
Attachments: A11E011I ESC BP Cmmt1-signed (1).pdf

Invoice (1).pdf

Hello Doug, 

Here is the payment confirmation for the first submission of McMahon Marketplace Building 9B.
Please let me know if you need any additional information. I attached the invoice and comment page
for reference purposes. 

Thank you and Merry Christmas! 

Madelyn Schauer  
Inspections Plus LLC  
Environmental Compliance Analyst  
505-895-1547 
403-740-3225 
madelyn@inspectionsplus.com 

From: Kate Carroll <bookkeeping@inspectionsplus.com>
Sent: Thursday, December 22, 2022 12:28 AM
To: Madelyn Schauer <madelyn@inspectionsplus.com>
Subject: FW: Payment Confirmation: 2022356001-1
 

Here is the confirmation.
 

From: system@ipayment.com <system@ipayment.com> 
Sent: Thursday, December 22, 2022 12:27 AM
To: Kate Carroll <bookkeeping@inspectionsplus.com>
Subject: Payment Confirmation: 2022356001-1
 

Tab icon

Receipt

mailto:phishing@cabq.gov
mailto:madelyn@inspectionsplus.com
mailto:jhughes@cabq.gov



           
                Alan Varela, Director                  Mayor Timothy M. Keller 


 
December 20, 2022 
 
 
James Tolman, CPESC 
Inspections Plus Inc. 
504 El Paraiso Rd. NE Suite B 
Albuquerque, NM 87113-1590 
 
Re: McMahon Market Place Lots 9B, 9C, & 9D - 5750 McMahon Blvd NW 


Erosion and Sediment Control Plan 
Engineer’s Stamp Date 11/28/2022 (A11E011I) 


 
Mr. Tolman, 
  
Based upon the information provided in your submittal received on 12/05/2022, the above 
referenced ESC Plan cannot be approved until the following comments are addressed. 


1. This site is already supposed to have permit coverage, but NMR1000WQ and 
NMR1002NB expired on 2/16/22 before the Final Stabilization Criteria of CGP 2.2.14 
was satisfied. NMR1002NB covered the last 2.5 acre part of a 9 acre “Common Plan of 
Development or Sale” owned by JMD-McMahon, LLC. This 2.5 acre part has been 
disturbed since 2014 and has never satisfied the Final Stabilization Criteria of CGP 
2.2.14, so JMD-McMahon, LLC must provide an NOI and ESC Plan covering the 
remaining disturbed area to the City for approval.  


2. The above referenced ESC Plan only covers Lot 9B which may be sufficient for the 
contractor’s area of control but the contractors’ plans don’t need to be approval by the 
City. Show all of the remaining disturbed property on the ESC Plan with temporary 
BMPs and the structures and stabilization that will be provided prior to filing the NOT. 


3. Correct the estimated area to be disturbed and the Project /Site Name on the property 
owner’s NOI. 


4. The SWPPP must include site-specific interim and permanent stabilization per CGP 
9.4.1.c.i.  The Landscape Plan can be used to satisfy this requirement and should be 
submitted separate from the ESC Plan with the application to the Stormwater Quality 
Section of the Planning Department and they should be included in the SWPPP. Provide 
a specification on the ESC Plan for any disturbed areas not covered by the Landscape 
Plan.  


5. Describe the nature and extent of construction activities (CGP 7.2.2.). Include the size of 
the property, and the size of the area of land disturbing activities. Provide a project 
schedule beginning with the initial establishment of the BMPs, posting of permit 
coverage, and any demolition covered by the permit. Describe the schedule of 
stabilization, timing of the removal of the BMPs and filing of the NOT. Describe 
construction support activities and show staging area on the ESC Plan. 







           
                Alan Varela, Director                  Mayor Timothy M. Keller 


6. Soil information – add a table with name type, particle sizes, and Erodibility factor (CGP 
2.1.1). Soil loss calculations are required in the SWPPP since this is part of a common 
plan of development that exceeds 5 acres. 


7. Update the engineer’s stamp date each time the plan is changed. 
 
If you have any questions, you can contact me at 924-3420 or jhughes@cabq.gov . 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
James D. Hughes, P.E. 
Principal Engineer, Planning Dept. 
Development and Review Services 


           James D. Hughes








CU-168061396Customer NO:


Reference NO: SI-2022-02413


504 EL PARAISO RD. NE  STE BCHIP MARTIN INSPECTIONS PLUS


CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
INVOICE


Date Description Amount


12/20/22 2% Technology Fee $12.10


12/20/22 Application Fee $605.00


12/20/22 Total due for this invoice:Due Date: $617.10


1.   Online with a credit card:   http://posse.cabq.gov/posse/pub/lms/Default.aspx


2.    In person: Plaza Del Sol, 600 2nd St. NW, Albuquerque, NM 87102


Options to pay your Invoice:


City of Albuquerque


CU-168061396Customer NO:


CHIP MARTIN INSPECTIONS PLUS
504 EL PARAISO RD. NE  STE B
ALBUQUERQUE, NM  87113


$617.10


SI-2022-02413Reference NO:


12/20/22


Amount Due:


Date:


Albuquerque, NM 87103


PO Box 1293


PLEASE RETURN THE BOTTOM PORTION OF THIS INVOICE NOTICE WITH PAYMENT


Payment Code: 130


130 0000SI20220241300099355117260453600000000000006171CU168061396







Your Reference Number:

2022356001-1
12/22/2022 12:24:57 AM

Transactions

Building Permits, Business Registrations, Code Enforcement Permits and
Planning Applications
 2022356001-1-1

$617.10

Name:
CHIP MARTIN INSPECTIONS PLUS - CU168061396
Customer Number:
CU168061396

Permit Information $605.00

Permit Number:
SI-2022-02413
Permit Description:
PL002: Planning: Application Fee (Site Improvement Plan)
Name:
CHIP MARTIN INSPECTIONS PLUS - CU168061396

Permit Information $12.10

Permit Number:
SI-2022-02413
Permit Description:
TF001: Planning: Technology Fee Application (Site Improvement Plan)
Name:
CHIP MARTIN INSPECTIONS PLUS - CU168061396

Total Amount:$617.10
Payment

ACH $617.10

CE2022356001-1


	SWQIS McMahon Marketplace
	Invoice2
	Fw_ Payment Confirmation_ 2022356001-1  ..

	Project Name 1: McMahon Marketplace BLVD 9B
	Project Name 2: 5760 McMahon BLVD NW, ABQ, NM 87114
	Company: Inspections Plus LLC 
	Contact: Madelyn Schauer
	Address: 504 El Paraiso Rd. NE STE B, ABQ, NM 87113
	Phone Number O: 5053449410
	Cell optional: 
	eMail: projects@inspectionsplus.com
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	Contact_2: Doug Peterson
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	Phone: 505-884-3578
	eMail_2: doug@petersonproperties.net
	C5+: 
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	SF5-40: 
	SF5: 
	105: x
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	Total Due: 375.00
	GR: x
	BP: x
	WO: 
	C2: x
	WO5: 
	MF5: 
	C2-5: 
	WO5-40: 
	MF5-40: 


