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Ryan Hart 8:31 AM
No preview is available.

Fri 6/30/2023 8:00 AM - 5:00 PM
No conflicts

Hawaiian Shirt Friday 

 RSVP

Last week

Jeffery Hatch Sat 8:21 AM
Please put this in the covered patio for brightstars as th…

Indoor Outdoor Carpet

kazlin.chandless@luxelocker.com Fri 12:28 PM
Please see below receipt. From: NOREPLY_cabq@ipaym…

Payment Confirmation: 2023166006-21

Pat Mills; J Beaucannon Wed 6/14
Low Priority Thank you, sir Best Regards, From: J Beauc…

 Luxelocker Chandler Building B/C S…  

DD-CCS-GP-02 …

J Beaucannon; Bergloff, Laurel Mon 6/12
Low Priority Thanks for the update. Justin R. Beaucann…

 Brightstar Care Overland - Elec…   

MAP.pdf +4

This month

Briley Thompson Fri 6/9
Hi y'all, I just updated the Room Finish Legend in the pr…

Luxelocker Proj. Template Update

Weston Thu 6/8
Id be worried with more complexity like the ribbing in t…

 Luxelocker Trash Enclosure  

Trash Enclosure.rfa

 Mesquite 

Payment Confirmation:
2023166006-21  



Fri 6/16/2023 12:28 PM

Please see below receipt.
 
From:
NOREPLY_cabq@ipayment.com
<NOREPLY_cabq@ipayment.com>
Sent: Friday, June 16, 2023 11:26
AM
To:
kazlin.chandless@luxelocker.com
Subject: Payment Confirmation:
2023166006-21
 

Receipt

Your Reference Number:

2023166006-21
06/16/2023 12:24:30 PM

Transactions

Building Permits,
Business
Registrations, Code
Enforcement
Permits and
Planning
Applications
&nbsp2023166006-
21-1

$923.10

Name:
JEFF HATCH - CU113882640
Customer Number:
CU113882640

Permit Information $905.00

Permit Number:
SI-2023-01097
Permit Description:
PL002: Planning: Application Fee
(Site Improvement Plan)
Name:
JEFF HATCH - CU113882640

Permit Information $18.10

Permit Number:
SI-2023-01097
Permit Description:
PL002: Planning: Application Fee
(Manual) (Site Improvement Plan)
Name:
JEFF HATCH - CU113882640

Total Amount:$923.10
Payment

ACH $923.10

CE2023166006-21

K kazlin.chandless@luxelocker.com     

To: 'David Ferrette' <d
Cc: Brian Francis <bria

Thank you! Received, thank you.

Got it, thanks!

Reply Reply all
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FW: Payment Confirmation: 2023166006-21

kazlin.chandless@luxelocker.com <kazlin.chandless@luxelocker.com>
Fri 6/16/2023 12:28 PM
To: 'David Ferrette' <david@luxelocker.com>;Nicholas <nicholas@hatchda.com>;Jeffery Hatch <jeff@hatchda.com>
Cc: Brian Francis <brian.francis@luxelocker.com>;Danielle Luxelocker <danielle.ahrens@luxelocker.com>

Please see below receipt.
 
From: NOREPLY_cabq@ipayment.com <NOREPLY_cabq@ipayment.com>
Sent: Friday, June 16, 2023 11:26 AM
To: kazlin.chandless@luxelocker.com
Subject: Payment Confirmation: 2023166006-21
 

Receipt

Your Reference Number:

2023166006-21
06/16/2023 12:24:30 PM

Transactions

Building Permits, Business Registrations, Code Enforcement Permits and Planning Applications
&nbsp2023166006-21-1 $923.10

Name:
JEFF HATCH - CU113882640
Customer Number:
CU113882640

Permit Information $905.00

Permit Number:
SI-2023-01097
Permit Description:
PL002: Planning: Application Fee (Site Improvement Plan)
Name:
JEFF HATCH - CU113882640

Permit Information $18.10

Permit Number:
SI-2023-01097
Permit Description:
PL002: Planning: Application Fee (Manual) (Site Improvement Plan)
Name:
JEFF HATCH - CU113882640

Total Amount:$923.10
Payment

ACH $923.10

CE2023166006-21

Print Close
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