From: Hughes, James D.

To: rtmfol@gmail.com
Cc: Cordero, Shannon D.
Subject: FW: B20E067 - 8500 Glendale Drive NE - Notice of Violation #3 Fine #1
Date: Tuesday, November 10, 2020 4:12:00 AM
Attachments: 8500 GLENDALE STORM WATER QUALITY.pdf
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Mr. Jones,

Please see attached invoice and instructions on how to pay online below. Please e-mail a pdf copy of

the receipt to Shannon and me.
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principal engineer construction SWQ
505.924.3420

lhughes@cabqg.gov

From: Cordero, Shannon D.

Sent: Monday, November 09, 2020 1:41 PM

To: Hughes, James D.

Subject: RE: B20E0O67 - 8500 Glendale Drive NE - Notice of Violation #3 Fine #1

Hello,

Here is the link and for permit number

http://payments.cabg.gov

Enter the permit number as shown below and click Find, Add to Cart, Checkout and then enter
payment information.

Let me know when it is paid so | can verify it cleared in Posse. | also attached a copy of your receipt for
your records. Thank you for your patience during this difficult time.


mailto:/O=EXCHANGEORG1/OU=EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP (FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=HUGHES JAMES D76F
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https://hes32-ctp.trendmicro.com/wis/clicktime/v1/query?url=http%3a%2f%2fpayments.cabq.gov&umid=ded03511-b78f-4afe-96ad-fe52f063487c&auth=c5e193b2792d33bbda0d14ee5f909adbb398f028-67b04530ca7e713f5e90039adc4c7ce7775e29fc

CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

JOHN JONES 5901 WYOMING BLVD NE STEJ 303
Reference NO: SI-2020-01263

Customer NO: CU-30622479

Date Description Amount
11/09/20 Application Fee (Manual) $500.00
Due Date: 11/09/20 Total due for this invoice: $500.00

Options to pay your Invoice:

1. Online with a credit card: http://posse.cabg.gov/posse/pub/Ims/Default.aspx
In person: Plaza Del Sol, 600 2nd St. NW, Albuquerque, NM 87102

PLEASE RETURN THE BOTTOM PORTION OF THIS INVOICE NOTICE WITH PAYMENT

: Date: 11/09/20
“& city of Albuguerque Amount Due:  $500.00
. PO Box 1293 Reference NO:  SI-2020-01263
,.Ii % Albuquerque, NM 87103 Payment Code: 130

Customer NO: CU-30622479

JOHN JONES
5901 WYOMING BLVD NE STE J 303
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87109

130 0000Ss1202001263000993551124140119000000000000500000CU30622479
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senior administrative assistant
505.924.3979
505.924.3979

Sdcordero@cabqg.gov

From: Hughes, James D.

Sent: Friday, November 6, 2020 2:41 PM

To: Cordero, Shannon D. <sdcordero@cabg.gov

Subject: FW: B20E067 - 8500 Glendale Drive NE - Notice of Violation #3 Fine #1
Please provide a $500 invoice for the above referenced project and address it to
John Mark Jones

5901 Wyoming Blvd. NE, Suite J303

Albuquerque NM 87109
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jhughes@cabg.gov

From: Hughes, James D.

Sent: Friday, November 06, 2020 11:55 AM

To: 'rtmf91@gmail.com' <rtmf91@gmail.com>

Cc: Biazar, Shahab <sbiazar@cabqg.gov>; Armijo, Ernest M. <earmijo@cabg.gov>; 'Esparza, David'
<esparza.david@epa.gov>

Subject: RE: B20EO67 - 8500 Glendale Drive NE - Notice of Violation #3 Fine #1

Mr Jones,

Please see attached 3" Notice of Violation. An invoice for the fine will be sent separately.
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jhughes@cabg.gov

From: Hughes, James D.

Sent: Tuesday, October 13, 2020 10:48 AM

To: 'rtmf91@gmail.com' <rtmf91@gmail.com>

Cc: Biazar, Shahab <sbiazar@cabg.gov>; Armijo, Ernest M. <earmijo@cabg.gov>
Subject: RE: B20EO67 - 8500 Glendale Drive NE - Notice of Violation

Mr Jones,

Please see attached 2" Notice of Violation. Since you have been cooperative and shown significant
progress by removing all of the loose dirt from the floodplain, the enforcement has not been escalated
to a fine. Another follow-up inspection will be scheduled for late next week to verify compliance with

the remaining areas of concern.
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jhughes@cabg.gov

From: Hughes, James D.
Sent: Wednesday, September 30, 2020 11:14 AM
To: 'rtmf91@gmail.com' <rtmf91@gmail.com>
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Cc: Biazar, Shahab <sbiazar@cabg.gov>; Armijo, Ernest M. <earmijo@cabg.gov>

Subject: B20OE067 - 8500 Glendale Drive NE - Notice of Violation

Mr Jones,

Please see attached notice of ESC Ordinance Violation. This site requires an ESC permit and BMPs. A

follow-up inspection is scheduled next Thursday to verify compliance.
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