
Total Due $____________  

If you have questions, please contact Doug Hughes, Stormwater Quality 924-3420, jhughes@cabq.gov 

Rev May 2019 

Stormwater Quality Plan Information Sheet 

and Inspection Fee Schedule 
Project Name: _________________________________________________________ 
Project Location:  (address or major cross streets/arroyo) 
_____________________________________________________________________ 
Plan Preparer Information: 
Company: _______________________________________________________________ 
Contact: ________________________________________________________________ 
Address: ________________________________________________________________ 

_________________________________________________________________ 
Phone Number: (O) _____________________ (Cell (optional)) _____________________ 
e-Mail:_________________________________________________________________ 

Property Owner Information: 
Company: _______________________________________________________________ 
Contact: _________________________________________________________________ 
Address: _________________________________________________________________ 
Phone: ___________________________________________________________________ 
e-Mail:___________________________________________________________________ 
I am submitting the ESC plan to obtain approval for: 

___ Grading  ___Building Permit  ___Work Order Construction Plans 
Note: More than one item can be checked for a submittal 

Stormwater Quality Inspection fee: (based on development type and disturbed area) 
Commercial < 2 acres $300        2 to 5 acres $500  >5 acres $800   
Land/Infrastructure < 5 acres $300     5 to 40 acres $500  >40 acres $800   
Multi - family < 5 acres $500   >5 acres $800 
Single Family 
Residential 

<5 acres $500 5 to 40 acres $1000 > 40 acres $1500  

Plan Review fee is $105 for the first submittal         and $75.00 for a resubmittal 

Total due equals the plan review fee plus the Stormwater Quality Inspection fee. 
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CU-113529761Customer NO:

Reference NO: SI-2022-02337

PO BOX 400GREEN GLOBE ENVIRONMENTAL MATHEW
VALLEJOS

CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
INVOICE

Date Description Amount

12/12/22 2% Technology Fee $18.10

12/12/22 Application Fee (Manual) $905.00

12/12/22 Total due for this invoice:Due Date: $923.10

1.   Online with a credit card:   http://posse.cabq.gov/posse/pub/lms/Default.aspx

2.    In person: Plaza Del Sol, 600 2nd St. NW, Albuquerque, NM 87102

Options to pay your Invoice:

City of Albuquerque

CU-113529761Customer NO:

GREEN GLOBE ENVIRONMENTAL
MATHEW VALLEJOS
PO BOX 400
LOS LUNAS , NM  87031

$923.10

SI-2022-02337Reference NO:

12/12/22

Amount Due:

Date:

Albuquerque, NM 87103

PO Box 1293

PLEASE RETURN THE BOTTOM PORTION OF THIS INVOICE NOTICE WITH PAYMENT

Payment Code: 130

130 0000SI20220233700099355117205233800000000000009231CU113529761



[EXTERNAL] Forward to phishing@cabq.gov and delete if an email
causes any concern.

From: Mathew Vallejos
To: Hughes, James D.
Subject: FW: Payment Confirmation: 2022356005-11
Date: Tuesday, December 27, 2022 8:42:35 AM
Attachments: image001.png

Mr. Hughes,
 
Please see below payment receipt for Wexford – Durango Unit 2.
 
Thank You,
 
Mathew Vallejos, CPESC, CISEC, E.I.
Green Globe Environmental, LLC
Cell: (505) 304-8473
Office: 1-888-712-5120
matt@greenglobenm.com
www.greenglobenm.com 

"YOUR ONE STOP EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL RETAILER" 
 

From: JL Murtagh <JL@wcinm.com> 
Sent: Friday, December 23, 2022 9:16 AM
To: Mathew Vallejos <matt@greenglobenm.com>
Cc: Tim Slatunas <tim@greenglobenm.com>
Subject: FW: Payment Confirmation: 2022356005-11
 
Good morning, Mathew,
 
Please see below for the payment confirmation for the Durango ESC fees.
 
Thanks,
JL
 

From: system@ipayment.com <system@ipayment.com> 
Sent: Friday, December 23, 2022 9:15 AM

mailto:phishing@cabq.gov
mailto:matt@greenglobenm.com
mailto:jhughes@cabq.gov
mailto:matt@greenglobenm.com
https://ddec1-0-en-ctp.trendmicro.com/wis/clicktime/v1/query?url=http%3a%2f%2fwww.greenglobenm.com&umid=8590d544-70ae-4340-b4f4-73de8ca18637&auth=307405480ca3e49a8b1deb4e49ca5cd244e7e096-b5c6d6dae4088269ab56e05cd5ed3c2da2454557
mailto:system@ipayment.com
mailto:system@ipayment.com

ENVIRONMENTAL





To: JL Murtagh <JL@wcinm.com>
Subject: Payment Confirmation: 2022356005-11
 

Tab icon

Receipt

Your Reference Number:

2022356005-11
12/23/2022 9:14:07 AM

Transactions

Building Permits, Business Registrations, Code Enforcement Permits and
Planning Applications
 2022356005-11-1

$923.10

Name:
GREEN GLOBE ENVIRONMENTAL MATHEW VALLEJOS - CU113529761
Customer Number:
CU113529761

Permit Information $905.00

Permit Number:
SI-2022-02337
Permit Description:
PL002: Planning: Application Fee (Manual) (Site Improvement Plan)
Name:
GREEN GLOBE ENVIRONMENTAL MATHEW VALLEJOS - CU113529761

Permit Information $18.10

Permit Number:
SI-2022-02337
Permit Description:
TF001: Planning: Technology Fee Application (Site Improvement Plan)
Name:
GREEN GLOBE ENVIRONMENTAL MATHEW VALLEJOS - CU113529761

Visa Service Fee
 2022356005-11-4

$25.39

Total Amount:$948.49
Payment

Visa Credit Sale M $923.10

mailto:JL@wcinm.com


Card Number:
************4272
First Name:
John
Last Name:
Murtagh
Auth Code:
03746D

Visa Service Fee Credit Sale M $25.39

Card Number:
************4272
First Name:
John
Last Name:
Murtagh
Payment Type:
credit
Auth Code:
03766D

CE2022356005-11
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	FW_ Payment Confirmation_ 2022356005-11

	Project Name 1: DURANGO UNIT 2
	Project Name 2: Weminuche Rd. NW and Molas Rd. NW
	Company: GREEN GLOBE ENVIRONMENTAL
	Contact: MATHEW VALLEJOS
	Address: PO BOX 400, LOS LUNAS, NM, 87031
	Phone Number O: 505-304-8473
	Cell optional: 
	eMail: MATT@GREENGLOBENM.COM
	Company_2: SONATA GREEN OWNER, LLC
	Contact_2: JOHN MURTAGH
	Address_2: 8201 GOLD COURSE RD. NW, STE. D3-338, ALBUQUERQUE, NM, 87120
	Phone: 702-376-5287
	eMail_2: JMURTAGH@WCINM.COM
	C5+: 
	WO40+: 
	SF5-40: 
	SF5: 
	105: X
	75: 
	Total Due: 905.00
	GR: X
	BP: X
	WO: 
	C2: 
	WO5: X
	MF5: 
	C2-5: 
	WO5-40: 
	MF5-40: 


