
Total Due $____________  

If you have questions, please contact Doug Hughes, Stormwater Quality 924-3420, jhughes@cabq.gov 

Rev Oct. 2020

Stormwater Quality Plan Information Sheet 

and Inspection Fee Schedule 
Project Name: _________________________________________________________ 
Project Location:  (address or major cross streets/arroyo) 
_____________________________________________________________________ 
Plan Preparer Information: 
Company: _______________________________________________________________ 
Contact: ________________________________________________________________ 
Address: ________________________________________________________________ 

_________________________________________________________________ 
Phone Number: (O) _____________________ (Cell (optional)) _____________________ 
e-Mail:_________________________________________________________________ 

Property Owner Information: 
Company: _______________________________________________________________ 
Contact: _________________________________________________________________ 
Address: _________________________________________________________________ 
Phone: ___________________________________________________________________ 
e-Mail:___________________________________________________________________ 
I am submitting the ESC plan to obtain approval for: 

___ Grading  ___Building Permit  ___Work Order Construction Plans 
Note: More than one item can be checked for a submittal 

Stormwater Quality Inspection fee: (based on development type and disturbed area) 
Commercial < 2 acres $300        2 to 5 acres $500  >5 acres $800   
Land/Infrastructure < 5 acres $300     5 to 40 acres $500  >40 acres $800   
Multi - family < 5 acres $500   >5 acres $800 
Single Family 
Residential 

<5 acres $500 5 to 40 acres $1000 > 40 acres $1500  

Plan Review fee is $105 for the first submittal         and $75.00 for a resubmittal 

Total due equals the plan review fee plus the Stormwater Quality Inspection fee. 



CU-168061396Customer NO:

Reference NO: SI-2023-00353

504 EL PARAISO RD. NE  STE BCHIP MARTIN INSPECTIONS PLUS

CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
INVOICE

Date Description Amount

2/14/23 2% Technology Fee $1.50

2/14/23 Application Fee $75.00

2/14/23 Total due for this invoice:Due Date: $76.50

1.   Online with a credit card:   http://posse.cabq.gov/posse/pub/lms/Default.aspx

2.    In person: Plaza Del Sol, 600 2nd St. NW, Albuquerque, NM 87102

Options to pay your Invoice:

City of Albuquerque

CU-168061396Customer NO:

CHIP MARTIN INSPECTIONS PLUS
504 EL PARAISO RD. NE  STE B
ALBUQUERQUE, NM  87113

$76.50

SI-2023-00353Reference NO:

2/14/23

Amount Due:

Date:

Albuquerque, NM 87103

PO Box 1293

PLEASE RETURN THE BOTTOM PORTION OF THIS INVOICE NOTICE WITH PAYMENT

Payment Code: 130

130 0000SI20230035300099355117589821100000000000000765CU168061396



From: Derek A. Kosilla
To: Adam Gromer; Stephen Pendergraft
Subject: (KLG 9 - Markana Latitude) FW: Payment Confirmation: 2023045001-36
Date: Tuesday, February 14, 2023 5:01:10 PM

 
 
Thank you,

Derek
Derek A Kosilla
Controller
Legacy Development & Management, LLC | Legacy Hospitality, Inc
5051 Journal Center Blvd | Suite 500 | Albuquerque, NM 87109
Office (505)205-1863
dkosilla@legacydm.net
Bellevue Office
150 120th Ave NE | Building F | Suite 305 | Bellevue, WA 98005
Legacydm.net @4vxR1Yz$R4B6
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules.
If you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system. The integrity and security
of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. This transmission is not a digital or electronic signature and cannot be
used to form, document, or authenticate a contract. Legacy Development & Management and its affiliates accept no liability
arising in connection with this transmission.

 

From: system@ipayment.com <system@ipayment.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, February 14, 2023 5:00 PM
To: Derek A. Kosilla <dkosilla@legacydm.net>
Subject: Payment Confirmation: 2023045001-36
 

Tab icon

Receipt

Your Reference Number:

2023045001-36
02/14/2023 4:55:33 PM

Transactions

Building Permits, Business Registrations, Code Enforcement Permits and
Planning Applications
 2023045001-36-1

$382.50

Name:
CHIP MARTIN INSPECTIONS PLUS - CU168061396
Customer Number:
CU168061396

Permit Information $375.00

Permit Number:

mailto:dkosilla@legacydm.net
mailto:aGromer@legacydm.net
mailto:spendergraft@legacydm.net
mailto:dkosilla@legacydm.net
https://ddec1-0-en-ctp.trendmicro.com/wis/clicktime/v1/query?url=http%3a%2f%2flegacydm.net&umid=e52f96e7-535a-4028-b135-9bae837680f9&auth=307405480ca3e49a8b1deb4e49ca5cd244e7e096-f685991e31f721f5244f663dc1d6933cd510e1b4


SI-2023-00348
Permit Description:
PL002: Planning: Application Fee (Site Improvement Plan)
Name:
CHIP MARTIN INSPECTIONS PLUS - CU168061396

Permit Information $7.50

Permit Number:
SI-2023-00348
Permit Description:
TF001: Planning: Technology Fee Application (Site Improvement Plan)
Name:
CHIP MARTIN INSPECTIONS PLUS - CU168061396

Total Amount:$382.50
Payment

ACH $382.50

CE2023045001-36
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless
you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

 


	SWQISMarkanaFlats
	Invoice
	(KLG 9 - Markana Latitude) FW_ Payment Confirmation_ 2023045001-36

	Project Name 1: Markana Flats
	Project Name 2: 7050 Construction Avenue NW, ABQ  NM 87110
	Company: Inspections Plus LLC
	Contact: Madelyn Schauer 
	Address: 504 El Paraiso Rd. NE STE B ABQ NM 87113
	Phone Number O: 505-344-9410
	Cell optional: 
	eMail: projects@inspectionsplus.com
	Company_2: Kassam Construction
	Contact_2: Stephen Pendergraft
	Address_2: 5051 Journal Center Blvd, Suite 500 ABQ, NM 87109
	Phone: 505-720-7188
	eMail_2: spendergraft@legacydm.net
	C5+: 
	WO40+: 
	SF5-40: 
	SF5: 
	105: 
	75: x
	Total Due: 375.00
	GR: x
	BP: x
	WO: 
	C2: x
	WO5: 
	MF5: 
	C2-5: 
	WO5-40: 
	MF5-40: 


