
Total Due $____________  

If you have questions, please contact Doug Hughes, Stormwater Quality 924-3420, jhughes@cabq.gov 

Rev May 2019 

Stormwater Quality Plan Information Sheet 

and Inspection Fee Schedule 
Project Name: _________________________________________________________ 
Project Location:  (address or major cross streets/arroyo) 
_____________________________________________________________________ 
Plan Preparer Information: 
Company: _______________________________________________________________ 
Contact: ________________________________________________________________ 
Address: ________________________________________________________________ 

_________________________________________________________________ 
Phone Number: (O) _____________________ (Cell (optional)) _____________________ 
e-Mail:_________________________________________________________________ 

Property Owner Information: 
Company: _______________________________________________________________ 
Contact: _________________________________________________________________ 
Address: _________________________________________________________________ 
Phone: ___________________________________________________________________ 
e-Mail:___________________________________________________________________ 
I am submitting the ESC plan to obtain approval for: 

___ Grading  ___Building Permit  ___Work Order Construction Plans 
Note: More than one item can be checked for a submittal 

Stormwater Quality Inspection fee: (based on development type and disturbed area) 
Commercial < 2 acres $300        2 to 5 acres $500  >5 acres $800   
Land/Infrastructure < 5 acres $300     5 to 40 acres $500  >40 acres $800   
Multi - family < 5 acres $500   >5 acres $800 
Single Family 
Residential 

<5 acres $500 5 to 40 acres $1000 > 40 acres $1500  

Plan Review fee is $105 for the first submittal         and $75.00 for a resubmittal 

Total due equals the plan review fee plus the Stormwater Quality Inspection fee. 

mfv57
Callout
Apply $605 credit.



CU-113529761Customer NO:

Reference NO: SI-2021-01666

PO BOX 400GREEN GLOBE ENVIRONMENTAL MATHEW
VALLEJOS

CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
INVOICE

Date Description Amount

10/06/21 2% Technology Fee $12.10

10/06/21 Application Fee (Manual) $605.00

10/06/21 Total due for this invoice:Due Date: $617.10

1.   Online with a credit card:   http://posse.cabq.gov/posse/pub/lms/Default.aspx

2.    In person: Plaza Del Sol, 600 2nd St. NW, Albuquerque, NM 87102

Options to pay your Invoice:

City of Albuquerque

CU-113529761Customer NO:

GREEN GLOBE ENVIRONMENTAL
MATHEW VALLEJOS
PO BOX 400
LOS LUNAS , NM  87031

$617.10

SI-2021-01666Reference NO:

10/06/21

Amount Due:

Date:

Albuquerque, NM 87103

PO Box 1293

PLEASE RETURN THE BOTTOM PORTION OF THIS INVOICE NOTICE WITH PAYMENT

Payment Code: 130

130 0000SI20210166600099355114629280700000000000006171CU113529761



From: Hughes, James D.
To: Ortiz, Annette; "Mathew Vallejos"; Ruiz Carlos, Lizbeth; Cordero, Shannon D.
Cc: Tim Slatunas
Subject: RE: Hiland Plaza Apartments ESC Plan Submittal - SI-2021-01666
Date: Wednesday, October 06, 2021 5:06:00 PM
Attachments: image001.jpg

image002.png
image003.png
image004.jpg

Finally I can get rid of this IOU.
 
cid:image003.jpg@01D41F50.A8AE0A90

DOUG HUGHES, P.E., CFM, CPESC
principal engineer construction SWQ
o 505.924.3420
e jhughes@cabq.gov
cabq.gov/planning
 
 

From: Ortiz, Annette 
Sent: Wednesday, October 06, 2021 4:55 PM
To: 'Mathew Vallejos' <matt@greenglobenm.com>; Ruiz Carlos, Lizbeth <lruizcarlos@cabq.gov>; Cordero, Shannon
D. <sdcordero@cabq.gov>
Cc: Hughes, James D. <jhughes@cabq.gov>; Tim Slatunas <tim@greenglobenm.com>
Subject: RE: Hiland Plaza Apartments ESC Plan Submittal - SI-2021-01666
 
Hi Mathew,
 
Thank you for sending that, I’ll make sure to zero out the fee and note as credit.  Disregard the invoice. 
 
 
Thank you,
Annette
 
cid:image004.jpg@01D768DC.03980FF0

Annette V. Ortiz
Planning Assistant II
Development Review Services
o 505.924.3861
e annetteortiz@cabq.gov
 

From: Mathew Vallejos <matt@greenglobenm.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 6, 2021 4:25 PM

mailto:annetteortiz@cabq.gov
mailto:matt@greenglobenm.com
mailto:lruizcarlos@cabq.gov
mailto:sdcordero@cabq.gov
mailto:tim@greenglobenm.com
mailto:jhughes@cabq.gov
https://www.cabq.gov/planning
mailto:annetteortiz@cabq.gov
mailto:matt@greenglobenm.com
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To: Ortiz, Annette <annetteortiz@cabq.gov>; Ruiz Carlos, Lizbeth <lruizcarlos@cabq.gov>; Cordero, Shannon D.
<sdcordero@cabq.gov>
Cc: Hughes, James D. <jhughes@cabq.gov>; Tim Slatunas <tim@greenglobenm.com>
Subject: RE: Hiland Plaza Apartments ESC Plan Submittal - SI-2021-01666
 
External                                                           
Hi Annette,
 
I believe I have a $605.00 credit per the attached email and would like to use it on this project.  It was noted on the
inspection fee schedule page as well.  Let me know if you have any questions.
 
Thank you,
 

Mathew F. Vallejos, CPESC, CISEC, E.I.
Green Globe Environmental

505-304-8473
http://www.greenglobenm.com
 

From: Ortiz, Annette <annetteortiz@cabq.gov> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 6, 2021 4:16 PM
To: Mathew Vallejos <matt@greenglobenm.com>; Ruiz Carlos, Lizbeth <lruizcarlos@cabq.gov>; Cordero, Shannon
D. <sdcordero@cabq.gov>
Cc: Hughes, James D. <jhughes@cabq.gov>; Tim Slatunas <tim@greenglobenm.com>
Subject: RE: Hiland Plaza Apartments ESC Plan Submittal - SI-2021-01666
 
Hello,
 
Here is the link and permit number for you to enter the application number NOT the project number.  Your
application number – SI-2021-01666
https://www.cabq.gov/311/pay-a-bill
 
Enter the permit number and click Find, Add to Cart, Checkout and then enter payment information.
 Let me know when it is paid so I can verify it cleared in Posse.  I also attached a copy of your receipt for
your records.  Thank you for your patience.
 

mailto:annetteortiz@cabq.gov
mailto:lruizcarlos@cabq.gov
mailto:sdcordero@cabq.gov
mailto:jhughes@cabq.gov
mailto:tim@greenglobenm.com
https://ddec1-0-en-ctp.trendmicro.com/wis/clicktime/v1/query?url=http%3a%2f%2fwww.greenglobenm.com&umid=ee113fd2-b2cc-4795-9d10-8054cf2ed827&auth=307405480ca3e49a8b1deb4e49ca5cd244e7e096-5494109042f962325ef25886130c2f55c40a44ca
mailto:annetteortiz@cabq.gov
mailto:matt@greenglobenm.com
mailto:lruizcarlos@cabq.gov
mailto:sdcordero@cabq.gov
mailto:jhughes@cabq.gov
mailto:tim@greenglobenm.com
https://ddec1-0-en-ctp.trendmicro.com/wis/clicktime/v1/query?url=https%3a%2f%2fwww.cabq.gov%2f311%2fpay%2da%2dbill&umid=ee113fd2-b2cc-4795-9d10-8054cf2ed827&auth=307405480ca3e49a8b1deb4e49ca5cd244e7e096-cbf659a05f92e800471a3c8bc372b44ef9f10269


 
 
 
Thank you,
Annette
 

Annette V. Ortiz
Planning Assistant II
Development Review Services
o 505.924.3861
e annetteortiz@cabq.gov
 

From: Mathew Vallejos <matt@greenglobenm.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 6, 2021 1:43 PM
To: Planning Development Review Services <PLNDRS@cabq.gov>
Cc: Hughes, James D. <jhughes@cabq.gov>; Tim Slatunas <tim@greenglobenm.com>
Subject: Hiland Plaza Apartments ESC Plan Submittal
 
Good afternoon,
 
Please see attached ESC Plan submittal for the Hiland Plaza Apartments project.  Let us know if you have any
questions.
 

mailto:annetteortiz@cabq.gov
mailto:matt@greenglobenm.com
mailto:PLNDRS@cabq.gov
mailto:jhughes@cabq.gov
mailto:tim@greenglobenm.com


Thank you,
 

Mathew F. Vallejos, CPESC, CISEC, E.I.
Green Globe Environmental

505-304-8473
http://www.greenglobenm.com
 

https://ddec1-0-en-ctp.trendmicro.com/wis/clicktime/v1/query?url=http%3a%2f%2fwww.greenglobenm.com&umid=ee113fd2-b2cc-4795-9d10-8054cf2ed827&auth=307405480ca3e49a8b1deb4e49ca5cd244e7e096-5494109042f962325ef25886130c2f55c40a44ca

	HILAND PLAZA APARTMENTS - ESC Plan stamped copy
	Invoice
	reciept666

	Project Name 1: HILAND PLAZA APARTMENTS
	Project Name 2: 5000 CENTRAL AVE. SE, ALBUQUERQUE, NM, 87106
	Company: GREEN GLOBE ENVIRONMENTAL
	Contact: MATHEW VALLEJOS
	Address: PO BOX 400, LOS LUNAS, NM, 87031
	Phone Number O: 505-304-8473
	Cell optional: 
	eMail: MATT@GREENGLOBENM.COM
	Company_2: GREATER ALBUQUERQUE HOUSING PARTNERSHIP
	Contact_2: FELIPE RAEL, EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR
	Address_2: 320 GOLD AVE. SE, SUITE 918
	Phone: 505-980-5922
	eMail_2: FELIPE@ABQGAHP.ORG
	C5+: 
	WO40+: 
	SF5-40: 
	SF5: 
	105: X
	75: 
	Total Due: 605.00
	GR: X
	BP: X
	WO: X
	C2: 
	WO5: 
	MF5: X
	C2-5: 
	WO5-40: 
	MF5-40: 


