
Total Due $____________  

If you have questions, please contact Doug Hughes, Stormwater Quality 924-3420, jhughes@cabq.gov 

Rev Oct. 2020

Stormwater Quality Plan Information Sheet 

and Inspection Fee Schedule 
Project Name: _________________________________________________________ 
Project Location:  (address or major cross streets/arroyo) 
_____________________________________________________________________ 
Plan Preparer Information: 
Company: _______________________________________________________________ 
Contact: ________________________________________________________________ 
Address: ________________________________________________________________ 

_________________________________________________________________ 
Phone Number: (O) _____________________ (Cell (optional)) _____________________ 
e-Mail:_________________________________________________________________ 

Property Owner Information: 
Company: _______________________________________________________________ 
Contact: _________________________________________________________________ 
Address: _________________________________________________________________ 
Phone: ___________________________________________________________________ 
e-Mail:___________________________________________________________________ 
I am submitting the ESC plan to obtain approval for: 

___ Grading  ___Building Permit  ___Work Order Construction Plans 
Note: More than one item can be checked for a submittal 

Stormwater Quality Inspection fee: (based on development type and disturbed area) 
Commercial < 2 acres $300        2 to 5 acres $500  >5 acres $800   
Land/Infrastructure < 5 acres $300     5 to 40 acres $500  >40 acres $800   
Multi - family < 5 acres $500   >5 acres $800 
Single Family 
Residential 

<5 acres $500 5 to 40 acres $1000 > 40 acres $1500  

Plan Review fee is $105 for the first submittal         and $75.00 for a resubmittal 

Total due equals the plan review fee plus the Stormwater Quality Inspection fee. 

Owner
Text Box
X

Owner
Text Box
(2)



CU-106315305Customer NO:

Reference NO: SI-2021-01890

19 RYAN RDCLARK CONSULTING ENGINEERS CLARK
CONSULTING ENGINEERS

CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE
INVOICE

Date Description Amount

11/10/21 2% Technology Fee $11.10

11/10/21 Application Fee $555.00

11/10/21 Total due for this invoice:Due Date: $566.10

1.   Online with a credit card:   http://posse.cabq.gov/posse/pub/lms/Default.aspx

2.    In person: Plaza Del Sol, 600 2nd St. NW, Albuquerque, NM 87102

Options to pay your Invoice:

City of Albuquerque

CU-106315305Customer NO:

CLARK CONSULTING ENGINEERS CLARK
CONSULTING ENGINEERS
19 RYAN RD
ALBUQUERQUE, NM  87105

$566.10

SI-2021-01890Reference NO:

11/10/21

Amount Due:

Date:

Albuquerque, NM 87103

PO Box 1293

PLEASE RETURN THE BOTTOM PORTION OF THIS INVOICE NOTICE WITH PAYMENT

Payment Code: 130

130 0000SI20210189000099355114847299200000000000005661CU106315305



From: Trushar Bhakta
To: Cordero, Shannon D.; Hughes, James D.; Planning Development Review Services; ccealbq@aol.com
Cc: chip@inspectionsplus.com; cassandra@inspectionsplus.com; Nimesh Patel; ritesh@reevainc.com
Subject: Re: ESC Plan comments #2 for Home 2 Suites 3021 University Blvd SE - M15E047
Date: Thursday, November 11, 2021 9:02:02 AM
Attachments: image.png

Outlook-3cfabtw1.png

External                           
Ok i just got this paid. 

Just an fyi i was not able to pay by credit card and had to do a ACH payment.  See confirmation below. 

Thanks, 

Trushar Bhakta, CPA
tbhakta@iconlodging.com
 
ICON Lodging
Phone: 432.940.3111
3341 Regent Blvd. 
Ste. 130 – 366
Irving, TX 75063 
www.iconlodging.com

This e-mail message may contain confidential or legally privileged information and is intended only for the use of the intended recipient(s).  Any unauthorized disclosure,
dissemination, distribution, copying or the taking of any action in reliance on the information herein is prohibited.  E-mails are not secure and cannot be guaranteed to be error
free as they can be intercepted, amended, or contain viruses.  Anyone who communicates with us by e-mail is deemed to have accepted these risks. ICON Lodging is not
responsible for errors or omissions in this message and denies any responsibility for any damage arising from the use of e-mail. Any opinion and other statement contained in
this message and any attachment are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.

From: ccealbq@aol.com <ccealbq@aol.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 11, 2021 9:34 AM
To: Trushar Bhakta <TBhakta@iconlodging.com>; sdcordero@cabq.gov <sdcordero@cabq.gov>; jhughes@cabq.gov
<jhughes@cabq.gov>; PLNDRS@cabq.gov <PLNDRS@cabq.gov>
Cc: chip@inspectionsplus.com <chip@inspectionsplus.com>; cassandra@inspectionsplus.com
<cassandra@inspectionsplus.com>; Nimesh Patel <NPatel@iconlodging.com>; ritesh@reevainc.com
<ritesh@reevainc.com>

mailto:TBhakta@iconlodging.com
mailto:sdcordero@cabq.gov
mailto:jhughes@cabq.gov
mailto:PLNDRS@cabq.gov
mailto:ccealbq@aol.com
mailto:chip@inspectionsplus.com
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mailto:NPatel@iconlodging.com
mailto:ritesh@reevainc.com
mailto:tbhakta@iconlodging.com
https://ddec1-0-en-ctp.trendmicro.com/wis/clicktime/v1/query?url=http%3a%2f%2fwww.iconlodging.com&umid=12d690ac-69a3-4c14-b58b-ab9c7abc1bef&auth=307405480ca3e49a8b1deb4e49ca5cd244e7e096-7a9735de09d67c41425106197b1c877357ffaf1c

Your transaction is complete — Thank you! PRINTABLE VERSION

YYour request for payment has been received.
An additional confirmation will be sent to your email account if it was provided with the payment.
YYour Reference Number: 2021315001-16

11/11/2021 8:57:18 AM

Total Amount: $566.10
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Subject: Re: ESC Plan comments #2 for Home 2 Suites 3021 University Blvd SE - M15E047
 
Trushar, try this: SI-2021-01890

Phil
Clark Consulting Engineers
surveying | planning | engineering
505-281-2444          505.264.6042 cell

-----Original Message-----
From: ccealbq@aol.com
To: sdcordero@cabq.gov <sdcordero@cabq.gov>; jhughes@cabq.gov <jhughes@cabq.gov>; PLNDRS@cabq.gov
<PLNDRS@cabq.gov>
Cc: chip@inspectionsplus.com <chip@inspectionsplus.com>; cassandra@inspectionsplus.com
<cassandra@inspectionsplus.com>; npatel@iconlodging.com <npatel@iconlodging.com>; ritesh@reevainc.com
<ritesh@reevainc.com>; tbhakta@iconlodging.com <tbhakta@iconlodging.com>
Sent: Thu, Nov 11, 2021 8:29 am
Subject: Re: ESC Plan comments #2 for Home 2 Suites 3021 University Blvd SE - M15E047

Good morning Shannon, plse note that the receipt has my address incorrectly.
19 Ryan Rd,
Edgewood, NM 87015
Trushar @ 1-432-940-3111 is asking what the invoice "application number" is?  Would it be possible to reach out to him? 

thx again,
Phil

Philip W. Clark, PE
Clark Consulting Engineers
surveying | planning | engineering
505-281-2444          505.264.6042 cell

-----Original Message-----
From: Cordero, Shannon D. <sdcordero@cabq.gov>
To: Hughes, James D. <jhughes@cabq.gov>; Planning Development Review Services <PLNDRS@cabq.gov>
Cc: Chip Martin <chip@inspectionsplus.com>; Cassandra Durkin <cassandra@inspectionsplus.com>; ccealbq@aol.com
<ccealbq@aol.com>; npatel@iconlodging.com <npatel@iconlodging.com>; ritesh@reevainc.com
<ritesh@reevainc.com>; tbhakta@iconlodging.com <tbhakta@iconlodging.com>
Sent: Wed, Nov 10, 2021 8:45 pm
Subject: RE: ESC Plan comments #2 for Home 2 Suites 3021 University Blvd SE - M15E047

 
Hello,
Here is the link and permit number for you to enter the application number https://www.cabq.gov/311/pay-a-bill
Enter the permit number and click Find, Add to Cart, Checkout and then enter payment information.
 Let me know when it is paid so I can verify it cleared in Posse.  I also attached a copy of your receipt for your
records.  Thank you for your patience.
 

https://ddec1-0-en-ctp.trendmicro.com/wis/clicktime/v1/query?url=https%3a%2f%2fwww.cabq.gov%2f311%2fpay%2da%2dbill&umid=12d690ac-69a3-4c14-b58b-ab9c7abc1bef&auth=307405480ca3e49a8b1deb4e49ca5cd244e7e096-a90d252c0b0f383d5dd6adc4b636f3a89f17103c
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	CLARK CONSULTING INVOICE SWQ
	reciept

	Project Name 1: Home 2 Suites
	Project Name 2: 3021 University Blvd SE  (University and Flightway)
	Company: Inspections Plus
	Contact: Cassandra Durkin, CPESC, CESSWI
	Address: 504 El Paraiso Rd NE Suite B Albuquerque, NM 87113
	Phone Number O: 505-344-9410
	Cell optional: 
	eMail: cassandra@inspectionsplus.com
	Company_2: ABQ Airport Lodging, LLC
	Contact_2: Anil Patel
	Address_2: 3341 Regent Blvd Irving, TX 75063
	Phone: 505-870-6491
	eMail_2: anil@reevainc.com
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	75: 
	Total Due: 555.00
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